

259 N. Meyer Ave.
Tucson, AZ 85701-1090
Phone: 520-624-8886
Fax: 520-798-1037
Tax ID No. 86-0259262

**MESCH, CLARK &
ROTHSCHILD P.C.**

A T T O R N E Y S

City of Benson
120 W. 6th Street
Benson, AZ 85602

April 2, 2015
Invoice No. 208824

Client: 20044 - City of Benson
Matter: 0001 - General

For Services Rendered Through March 31, 2015

Total for Services	17,027.50
Total for Expenses	1.80
Total for Services and Expenses	<u>\$17,029.30</u>
Past Due Balance	4,096.63
Payments Since Last Bill	-4,096.63
Amount Due	<u>\$17,029.30</u>

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill
will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
Page 1

Re: 0001 General

Professional Services

Date		Services	Hours	Amount
03/02/15	GJC	Confer with review and review	0.40	70.00
03/03/15	GJC	Call to to discuss	0.70	122.50
03/03/15	GJC	Call to to discuss	0.30	52.50
03/03/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.10	17.50
03/03/15	GJC	Review correspondence from	0.20	35.00
03/03/15	KLW	Conference with	0.40	70.00
03/03/15	GJC	Initial research on	2.00	350.00
03/03/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.40	70.00
03/03/15	GJC	Phone conversation with	0.50	87.50
03/03/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.10	17.50
03/03/15	GJC	Review and revise draft	0.40	70.00
03/03/15	KLW	Conducted research re:	1.20	210.00
03/03/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.10	17.50
03/03/15	PAL	Respond to	2.50	437.50

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill
will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
Page 2

Professional Services

Date		Services		Hours	Amount
03/03/15	PAL	Review response to	and	0.30	52.50
03/03/15	PAL	Conference with		0.30	52.50
03/04/15	GJC	Review and approve draft		0.20	35.00
03/04/15	GJC	Research		3.00	525.00
03/04/15	GJC	Review and revised draft and submit		1.00	175.00
03/04/15	GJC	Call from		0.40	70.00
03/04/15	GJC	Review correspondence from		0.20	35.00
03/04/15	GJC	Research re then review, edit and approve		0.70	122.50
03/04/15	GJC	Correspondence to		0.30	52.50
03/05/15	GJC	Research and advise		1.50	262.50
03/05/15	GJC	Initial review of draft confer with		1.00	175.00
03/05/15	GJC	Initial review of confer on such with		1.00	175.00
03/05/15	GJC	Review drafts of		1.00	175.00
03/05/15	PAL	Review		1.00	175.00
03/05/15	KLW	Conducted additional research re:		1.00	175.00

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill
will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
Page 3

Professional Services

Date		Services	Hours	Amount
03/06/15	PAL	Telephone call with	0.60	105.00
		review and revise same.		
03/06/15	PAL	Conferences with	0.50	87.50
03/07/15	KLW	Drafted memo	1.20	210.00
03/08/15	KLW	Drafted memo re:	3.90	682.50
03/09/15	GJC	Call from	0.30	52.50
03/09/15	KLW	Conferences with	0.40	70.00
03/09/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.30	52.50
03/09/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.20	35.00
03/09/15	GJC	Review correspondence	0.20	35.00
03/09/15	GJC	Correspondence,	0.30	52.50
03/09/15	GJC	Research and then draft and send correspondence to	0.70	122.50
03/09/15	GJC	Prepare for	1.00	175.00
03/09/15	GJC	Attend Worksession and Regular Meeting of Mayor and Council	4.00	700.00
03/09/15	GJC	Travel to Benson for tonight's regular meeting and work session	0.70	61.25
03/09/15	GJC	Travel back to Tucson from Benson after tonight's regular meeting and work session	0.70	61.25
03/09/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
 Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
 Page 4

Professional Services

Date		Services	Hours	Amount
03/09/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50
03/09/15	PAL	Review and revise memo on	0.70	122.50
03/10/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50
03/10/15	KLW	Conducted research re: conference with re: same;	1.50	262.50
03/10/15	GJC	Review and discuss with	0.20	35.00
03/10/15	GJC	Extensive research, and consultation with after which lengthy teleconference with	8.00	1,400.00
03/10/15	PAL	Conferences with ; telephone call to	1.00	0.00
03/11/15	KLW	Reviewed email correspondence from conducted research re:	0.70	122.50
03/11/15	GJC	Confer with	1.00	175.00
03/11/15	PAL	Telephone call from conference with	1.00	175.00
03/12/15	KLW	Conducted research on drafted memo	2.00	350.00
03/12/15	PAL	Draft	1.00	175.00

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill
 will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
Page 5

Professional Services

Date		Services	Hours	Amount
03/13/15	GJC	Review/Study	0.50	87.50
03/13/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50
03/13/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.10	17.50
03/13/15	GJC	Initial Research re	1.00	175.00
03/13/15	GJC	Conference with	0.30	52.50
03/13/15	GJC	Review correspondence from	0.10	17.50
03/13/15	GJC	Review/study correspondence from	0.30	52.50
03/13/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.30	52.50
03/13/15	GJC	Call from	0.70	122.50
03/13/15	GJC	Research re and advise	1.00	175.00
03/15/15	PAL	Review provide comments and respond.	0.50	87.50
03/16/15	GJC	Call from	0.30	52.50
03/16/15	GJC	Research	3.00	525.00
03/16/15	GJC	Review email inquiry from	1.00	175.00
03/16/15	PAL	Multiple conferences with	1.00	175.00
03/17/15	GJC	Call from	1.00	175.00
03/17/15	GJC	Call from	0.30	52.50

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill
will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
 Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
 Page 6

Professional Services

Date		Services	Hours	Amount
03/17/15	GJC	Call from	0.30	52.50
03/17/15	GJC	Review and send correspondence and draft	0.50	87.50
03/17/15	PAL	Telephone calls with and review	0.50	87.50
03/17/15	PAL	Telephone calls with telephone calls with	0.50	87.50
03/18/15	GJC	Research re draft and send correspondence to	0.40	70.00
03/18/15	GJC	Draft resolution re	1.00	175.00
03/18/15	GJC	Review and revise	0.70	122.50
03/18/15	GJC	Draft	1.50	262.50
03/18/15	PAL	Review draft letter to	0.30	52.50
03/19/15	GJC	Completely revise and re-tool draft research	2.00	350.00
03/19/15	GJC	Correspondenc to	0.30	52.50
03/19/15	GJC	Review question from research, consult with and then draft and send response via correspondence to	1.00	175.00
03/20/15	MR	Conference with	0.20	35.00
03/20/15	GJC	Review	1.00	175.00
03/20/15	GJC	Review and respond to question from	0.30	52.50

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
Page 7

Professional Services

Date		Services	Hours	Amount
03/20/15	PAL	Conference with	0.30	52.50
03/23/15	GJC	Prepare for	1.00	175.00
03/23/15	GJC	Travel from Tucson to Benson for tonight's meetings	0.70	61.25
03/23/15	GJC	Travel from Benson back to Tucson after tonight's meetings	0.70	61.25
03/23/15	MR	Conference with	0.10	17.50
03/23/15	GJC	Review and respond to	0.30	52.50
03/23/15	KLW	Completed research for memo re:	0.50	87.50
03/23/15	GJC	Call from	1.00	175.00
03/23/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.30	52.50
03/23/15	GJC	Attend tonights special and regular meetings of the Mayor and Council in Benson	3.90	682.50
03/24/15	GJC	Research and respond to	0.40	70.00
03/24/15	GJC	Correspondence to	0.20	35.00
03/24/15	GJC	Review and respond to	0.30	52.50
03/24/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50
03/24/15	GJC	Review notice re	0.10	17.50
03/24/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50
03/24/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50
03/24/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50
03/24/15	GJC	Review	0.10	17.50

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
 Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
 Page 8

Professional Services

Date	Services	Hours	Amount
03/24/15	GJC Review	0.10	17.50
03/24/15	GJC Review	0.10	17.50
03/24/15	GJC report Review	0.10	17.50
03/25/15	GJC Call from	0.30	52.50
03/25/15	GJC Call from	0.30	52.50
03/26/15	GJC Review	0.30	52.50
03/26/15	GJC Correspondence to	0.30	52.50
03/26/15	GJC Review, edit and then advise	0.40	70.00
03/26/15	GJC Correspondence from and to	0.30	52.50
03/26/15	GJC Review and discuss correspondence from	0.20	35.00
03/26/15	GJC Research re review and advise then	1.00	175.00
03/26/15	GJC Review packet for next meeting and discuss with	0.30	52.50
03/30/15	GJC Correspondence to	0.30	52.50
03/30/15	GJC Follow up call from	0.50	87.50
03/30/15	GJC Research prepare and send and then	1.00	175.00
03/31/15	GJC Draft and send	1.00	175.00

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
 Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
 Page 9

Professional Services

Date	Services	Hours	Amount
03/31/15	GJC Memo to	1.00	175.00
03/31/15	GJC Correspondence to	0.10	17.50
03/31/15	GJC Review	0.30	52.50
03/31/15	GJC Correspondence to	0.20	35.00
03/31/15	GJC Correspondence to	0.30	52.50
03/31/15	GJC Call to	0.30	52.50
03/31/15	GJC Review and advise on	0.70	122.50
03/31/15	GJC Call from	0.30	52.50
03/31/15	GJC Call from	0.70	122.50
03/31/15	GJC Travel to Benson for tonight's special meeting	0.70	61.25
03/31/15	GJC Travel from Benson to Tucson after tonight's Special Meeting	0.70	61.25
03/31/15	GJC Attend	1.70	297.50

Summary of Services

		Rate	Hours	Amount
GJC	Gary J. Cohen	87.50	4.20	367.50
GJC	Gary J. Cohen	175.00	71.10	12,442.50
MR	Mark Rubin	175.00	0.30	52.50
PAL	Paul A. Loucks	0.00	1.00	0.00
PAL	Paul A. Loucks	175.00	11.00	1,925.00
KLW	Kristen L. Wendler	175.00	12.80	2,240.00
Total for Services			100.40	\$17,027.50

Disbursements

Date	Expenses	Amount
------	----------	--------

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill will appear on the next bill.

Mesch, Clark & Rothschild, P.C.

Client Ref: 20044 - 0001
Invoice No. 208824

April 2, 2015
Page 10

Disbursements

Date	Expenses	Amount
	Duplication Expense thru 03/31/15	1.80
Total Expenses		<u>\$1.80</u>
	Total for Services and Expenses	<u><u>\$17,029.30</u></u>
	Past Due Balance	4,096.63
	Payments Since Last Bill	-4,096.63
	Amount Due	<u><u>\$17,029.30</u></u>

Payments received and/or disbursements made for your account which are not reflected on this bill will appear on the next bill.